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M
y orthopaedic colleagues are 

generally ‘concrete-thinking’ and 

grounded in simplicity and com-

mon sense. I remember being 

attracted to orthopaedics as a young student, 

because a patient with a problem was usually 

treated by a carefully planned procedure. When 

good results were obtained by a patient inter-

vention, the results were gratifying for all. We 

live in this world of carefully planned ‘concrete 

and simple’ interventions every day, yet when it 

comes to our own lives, many surgeons have a 

hard time planning their own retirement. Why 

is it so hard for us to believe that after about 50 

years of age, we start going downhill with cog-

nitive and psychomotor skill deterioration and 

other effects of ageing? Do we think that we are 

not like the rest of humanity? Are we immune 

from the effects of ageing? I was faced with this 

conundrum as my practice was getting on in 

years and my 35th medical class reunion came 

to be. My wife (a family physician) and I had 

been planning retirement for a number of years 

but it was noticed by many that I had not made 

my planned retirement date of ‘freedom age 55’. 

These retirement questions started to become 

more and more acute as I had bragged to col-

leagues that I was going to retire ‘on top’ and 

not be a bad example to others. Could I not pull 

myself away from the trap of orthopaedic prac-

tice until I was no longer an asset to the hospital?

To put all of this topic into perspective, 25 
years ago, D. H. Powell, a prominent Harvard 
psychologist and Director of Research in 
Behavioral Science, wrote that humans will 

start to demonstrate all or some of the below 
listed traits by their late 40s:1 1) impaired health 
and general function; 2) diminished hearing 
and sight; 3) loss of muscular mass and 
strength; 4) decreased endurance and stamina; 
5) impaired reaction time; 6) neurocognitive 
decline; and 7) diminished memory and atten-
tion span.

These are very general and nonspecific state-
ments, but why should they apply to me? I 
could manage to keep up with my residents 
going down the ski hill – why not in the operat-
ing theatre? Well, in 2008, Boom-Saad et al2 
reported an interesting study where they com-
pared medical students and surgeons perform-
ing a series of neuropsychological tests versus 
normative age-matched controls. Medical stu-
dents performed the best and all surgeons 
showed decline in function with age, but were 
better than their normative age-matched con-
trols.2 This decline starts at about 45 to 50 years 
of age. Knowledge and experience are main-
tained the longest but the first physiological 
asset to go is strength (starting in the mid-30s), 
then eyesight (at around 45 years of age), then 
dexterity, and finally cognition (around 60 years 
of age).3 Personally, I thought that my patients 
and operative cases were doing well and were 
not showing up weekly on the morbidity and 
mortality lists. But what was it that was keeping 
me functioning at a high enough level to be an 
academic orthopaedic trauma surgeon? Was 
my 30 years of experience the only attribute 
keeping me in the game at a high level? My 
physical attributes were slowing eroding, but 

maybe I was making better day-to-day decisions 
around my patient’s wellbeing.

So, to summarize so far, these papers – and 
many more with the same information4-6 – state 
that notwithstanding innate and acquired tech-
nical and cognitive skills, surgeons experience 
age-related psychomotor and neurocognitive 
decline. Besides the fact that we are terrible at 
self-assessment, – as a JAMA article puts it, we 
tend to suffer from “Superman syndrome”7 – 
time marches along and, unbeknown to us, is 
stealing our very mental and physical talents. 
Our ability to self-assess is a real hindrance, as 
we see things through a fading lens that we do 
not get regularly changed to keep in sharp 
focus. Mental acuity will make up for a lot but, 
at some point, it becomes obvious that we are 
not what we used to be. We all have seen the 
elderly surgeon coming in for rounds and sit-
ting in their office (doing God knows what). But 
what quality of work is being done by this 
elderly surgeon? Are they safe? Who, if any-
body, is checking on their work?

Rovit8 has put forth three reasons why sur-
geons resist retiring: 1) lack of self-esteem; 2) 
fear of death; and 3) resistance to change. The 
bravado that is a part of surgeons’ everyday life, 
as they interact with their patients and their 
families, becomes a part of one’s character. And 
the statement that “surgery is for patients but 
not surgeons” makes retirement look like the 
surgeon is giving up on life as they take on a 
more pedestrian role.3 Giving up on surgery is a 
large change – the surgeon is unsure if they can 
tolerate the new circumstances and is aware 
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that the decision to retire is irrevocable.5 To be a 
functioning part of a major polytrauma case 
one day and then retired the next day, sitting on 
the porch, is a huge transition. Arguably, only 
astronauts have a more dramatic change fol-
lowing retirement compared with surgeons. 
We are confronted every day with mammoth 
excitement and responsibility as we perform 
our surgical speciality. It can be a tough change 
to go from something so acute to a very quiet 
existence unless retirement has been planned 
carefully. Perhaps we think that we can put off 
dying if we keep working!

The stages of personal change that occur 
when one moves from an active surgical career 
into a more leisurely time in their life can be lik-
ened to the stages experienced after other life-
changing events (Fig. 2), such as losing a loved 
one.

Often, there is some sadness and a bit of 
anger that it is time to leave an active practice, 
but with the passage of time, the discovery of a 
“new self” with different personal goals and 

meaning creates a new purpose and inner 
direction for a retiree or someone transitioning 
into retirement.9 This is different for each per-
son, as everyone has a different pathway 
through this time of one’s life. Surgeons that 
purposefully plan this personal transition are 
invariably more gently placed onto the other 
side of this chasm after leaving the surgical suite 
for good.

Kelly10 stated that it was more important to 
have intrinsic features pushing a surgeon than 
extrinsic features. Extrinsic features such as 
income and positive adulation have been found 
to be less sustaining and associated with less 
fulfillment, lower vitality, and even physical 
symptoms. Intrinsic features such as personal 
worth, purpose, and service are much more 
sustaining in the long run. Purpose can be 
injected into one’s life by simply measuring 
each activity’s contribution towards a goal that 
we believe is worthy or fulfilling.10 Finding pur-
pose and meaning requires an act of will; it is 
something we must decide to pursue and 

create. Examples of these goals can be found in 
every area of human endeavour: from travelling 
to mission work; from starting a new part-time 
career to going back to school to pursue another 
degree.

Lillis and Milligan,11 in 2017, stated that 
while doctors display higher than average per-
formance on tests of cognition and start at a 
higher baseline level, decline in cognitive func-
tion with age parallels that of age-matched con-
trols. And because doctors are more prone than 
the general population to depression (1 in 5 
doctors), suicide, and drug and alcohol abuse, 
we must be vigilant in having a plan in place in 
relation to a retirement strategy that provides 
financial stability, self-worth, and respect. Tuli12 
stated that there are some long-known predic-
tors of life satisfaction. These include: 1) good 
mental, physical, and spiritual health; 2) finan-
cial security; 3) good family relationships; and 
4) healthy retirement activities, such as volun-
teering, travel, sport, and personal studies.12 
Pannor Silver and Easty13 found that most aca-
demic physicians would like to retire gradually 
rather than stopping suddenly. The “drop off of 
the cliff” was very hard to accept and a more 
gradual diminishment of workload resulted in a 
better personal outcome.13 This study also 
found that many barriers existed to retirement 
planning, including poor financial manage-
ment and static professional norms (profes-
sional culture favoured work over all other 
aspects of life).13 Surgeons stated that constant 
hard work limited time to plan for retirement 
and to develop hobbies and other interests. 
There were also many poor surgeon role mod-
els, none of whom were retiring easily. Mentors 
were needed who had successfully passed 
through this life phase.

Fig. 1  The stages of life.

Pe
rf

o
rm

an
ce

Time

Life-changing
event

Denial
and fear

Resistance
and anger

Depression

Transforming
idea

Exploration

Acceptance

Commitment

Fig. 2  The stages experienced following a life-changing event, such as transition from active clinical 

practice into a different ‘reinvented’ environment.
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When surveyed as to what they would have 
done to make retirement better, retirees would 
have: 1) retired earlier as it was equal or better 
than expected (89%); 2) planned for retirement 
earlier and better (financial planning and per-
sonal hobbies); and 3) spent more time with 
family.14 Solutions to the barriers to planning 
for retirement all involved more careful financial 
management such as limiting spending, avoid-
ing divorce, and securing help in money mat-
ters at an early age.14

Professional norms all pointed towards sur-
geons having a difficult time with adjusting to 
loss of prestige in the hospital setting and per-
sonal self-esteem issues and insecurity. The life-
long pursuit of hobbies and personal interests 
helped surgeons transition into their “new 
self”.9 This transition was a delicate phase after 
the surgeon decided to slow down from normal 
clinical work. The stages of this transition are 
similar to the phases of a life-changing event 
(Fig. 2), such as a significant loss or death. They 
involved the reinventing of oneself upon a dif-
ferent idea or concept and then committing to 
this ideal. During the “redirection” phase, retir-
ees develop a “new self”.9 This “new self” is 
happy to be away from tight scheduling, patient 
problems, and onerous hospital committee 
work, and is free to instead pursue more leisure 
time or more pleasant academic work. There is 
more time for family pursuits, especially as 
grandchildren come along. The transition from 
busy clinician to retiree should be gradual and 
allows for a personal shift of self-worth, and at 
the same time provides more time for mentor-
ing/teaching young surgeons. Personal health 
can be enhanced as one adjusts to age restric-
tions with time available for more sleep, fitness, 
and seeing family.13

In another recent article, Silver et al15 carried 
out a systematic review that suggested there are 
many possible successful means to aid physician 
retirement planning. These included having 
group knowledge of retirement plans, promot-
ing physician retirement mentorship pro-
grammes, guidance around career financial 
planning, and providing physician part-time 

work such as teaching, sabbaticals, and flexibil-
ity around retirement. Less on-call time and less 
case-mix complexity was also imperative to a 
fruitful transition out of clinical work for older 
physicians, but also gave opportunities for new 
highly trained young surgeons.15 Physicians 
express concern over the decision to retire due 
to the fear of losing their primary identity or pur-
pose, and an escape route must be planned for 
everyone that provides flexibility for individual 
needs. Many surgeons have a desire to do some-
thing productive, to have a place in society, and 
to be part of a group. Many older surgeons 
know that the satisfactions derived from work-
ing cannot be taken for granted. Retirement 
resource toolkits are thought to be a useful 
adjunct to other aforementioned suggestions to 
assist surgeons in a successful transition to work-
ing less.15 Reinventing or reconstructing oneself 
takes energy and creativity. It is a time-intensive 
process and should not be presumed to be easy.

Being a surgeon is perhaps the most privi-
leged of all occupations.3 It may be one of the 
reasons why surgeons do not want to give up 
their craft as their skills are deteriorating, because 
there is no such activity as rewarding. Surveys 
show that surgeons are happy with retirement 
once they have slowed down,10,12,14 but an 
alarmingly high number of senior surgeons 
(11%) had no plans to retire at all.14 Interestingly, 
retired surgeons who had taken up post-
retirement activities outside of medicine were 
more likely to be satisfied than those who 
remained in medicine in some nonsurgical 
capacity.3

If this editorial is to assist anyone, it must 
drive home three points: 1) skills and cognition 
fail over time and we can’t see it in ourselves; 2) 
planning makes retirement quite acceptable to 
most surgeons; and 3) retirement means the 
redirection and reinvention of one’s self, and 
this decision is an active, energy-consuming 
process.

My message can be summarized by the 
words of a 64-year-old surgeon who had been 
retired for three years. He said one needs three 
things for successful retirement: 1) enough 

money; 2) outside interests; and 3) knowing in 
one’s heart that one’s self-worth is not depend-
ent upon being a doctor.16 So, go away and 
think about this editorial. Are you planning suf-
ficiently for your retirement and are you pre-
pared for a significant life’s change?
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